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DECLARATION BETWEEN THE UNITED

KINGDOM AND FRANCE PROLONGING

FOR ONE YEAR THE DECLARATION OP

DECEMBER 11, 1888, REGULATING TELE-

GRAPHIC COMMUNICATION BETWEEN

THE TWO COUNTRIES.

Signed at London, March 20, 1899.

[Ratifications exchanged at Paric, December 30, 1899.]

Tim Government of Her
Britannic -Majesty- and the
Government of the French
Republic, considering that delay
is actually necessary for the
competent Departments of the
two countries to prepare a new
Agreement in order to regulate
the telegraphic cmnmtinications
between the two States, and to
replace the Act approved by the
Anglo - French Declaration of
the 11th December, 1888, which
will expire on the 1st April,
1899, have agreed upon the
following arrangement:-

The stipulations of the
Declaration signed at London
on the 11th December, 1885,
between the Government of
Her Britannic Majesty and the
Government or the French Re-
public to regulate telegraphic

[61]

LE Gouvernentent de Sit Ma-
jeste Britanniquc et he Gon-
vermement de la Republique
Frangaise, conside'rant que des
delais sont actuellenrout neees-
saires aux Administrations com-
petentes des deux pays pour
preparer tut nouvel Arrange-
nent destine a regler les
relations telegraphiqties entre
les deux hats, et a remplacer
l'Acte approuvG par la Declara-
tion Anglo-Frangaise du 11 Dd-
centbre, 1888, dont les effets
doivent cesser le 10? Avril, 1899,
sont convenus de la disposition
smvante :-

"Les stipulations do la De-
claration signee a Londres le
11 Decentbre, 1888, entre le
Gouvernement de la Grande-
I.rctagme et le Gonvernement
do la Republique Fran4aiso pour
rdgler los relations tclegra-
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communications between the
British Isles and France shall
be prolonged for one year, that
is to say, from the 31st March,
1899, to the 31st March,
1900."

4

phiques entre les Iles Britan-
nique of la France sont prorogees
d'une annex, ii savoir, (in
31 Mars, 1890, an 31 Mars,
1900."

The present Declaration shall
be ratified, and the ratifications
shall be exchanged as soon as
possible.

In witness whereof, Her Ma-
jesty's Principal Secretary of
State for Foreign Affairs and
his Excellency the Ambassador
of the French Republic at the
Court of Her Majesty the Queen
of Great Britain and Ireland,
Empress of India, duly autho-
rized for that purpose, have
signed it, and have affixed
thereto their seals.

La presente Declaration sera
ratifiee, et les ratifications en
seront echaugees aussitot quo
faire se pourra.

En foi de quoi, son Excellence
le principal Seeretaire d'Etat do
Sa Majeste Britannique et son
Excellence l'Ambassadeur de la
Republique FranFaise pros Sa
Majeste la Reine de In Grande.
Bretagne et d'Irlande, Impera-
trice des Indes, dement autorises
.1 cot elfet, l'ont signee, et y out
appose leurs cachets.

r^ Done at London, in duplicate, Fait d. Londres; en double ox-
the 20th day of March, 1899. pedition, le 20 Mars, 1899.

(L.S.) SALISBURY. - (L.S.) SALISBURY.
(L.S.) PAUL CAMBON. (L.S.) PAUL CAMBON.


